

			EZ Disposal & Recycling		Russell Disposal		Capitol Waste		Waste Management		
Service			Contract Sections	Description	FY15	7-yr Total	FY15	7-yr Total	FY15	7-yr Total	
ITEM 1. Solid Waste Collection	SOLID WASTE - FIVE DAY PER WEEK COLLECTION										
	Manual collection (continuing the status quo) for Solid Waste	1-C, 2-A, 2-C, 2-F, 2-G, 3-A, 3-C, 3-E(a), 3-F through 3-T, Article 4	Cost per year	\$ 1,638,381.00	\$ 12,144,009.00	\$ 1,811,040.00	\$ 13,678,884.00	\$ 1,974,972.00	\$ 14,553,379.00	\$ 1,911,564.00	\$ 14,647,286.86
	Automated collection using a 64 gallon container with potential for overflow program	1-C, 2-A, 2-B, 2-C, 2-H, 2-I, 3-A, 3-B, 3-C, 3-E(a), 3-F through T, Article 4	Cost per year	\$ 1,437,565.00	\$ 10,655,522.00	\$ 1,347,900.00	\$ 10,195,210.00	\$ 1,572,652.00	\$ 10,948,721.00	\$ 1,647,900.00	\$ 12,626,971.43
	SOLID WASTE - ONE DAY PER WEEK COLLECTION										
	Manual collection for Solid Waste	1-C, 2-A, 2-C, 2-F, 2-G, 3-A, 3-C, 3-E(a), 3-F through 3-T, Article 4	Cost per year	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Automated collection using a 64 gallon container with potential for overflow program	1-C, 2-A, 2-B, 2-C, 2-H, 2-I, 3-A, 3-B, 3-C, 3-E(a), 3-F through T, Article 4	Cost per year	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ITEM 2. Biweekly and Weekly Recycling	RECYCLING - FIVE DAY PER WEEK (BIWEEKLY) COLLECTION										
	Manual collection (continuing the status quo) for Recycling	1-C, 2-A, 2-D, 3-A, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F through 3-T, Article 4	Cost per year	\$ 795,139.00	\$ 5,893,732.00	\$ 849,600.00	\$ 6,417,000.00	\$ 786,137.00	\$ 4,915,264.00	\$ 785,519.00	\$ 6,019,009.63
	Automated collection using a 96 gallon container	1-C, 2-A, 2-B, 2-C, 2-H, 2-D, 3-A, 3-B, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F through T, Article 4	Cost per year	\$ 925,000.00	\$ 6,856,287.00	\$ 825,600.00	\$ 6,244,896.00	\$ 968,727.00	\$ 6,586,457.00	\$ 1,239,221.00	\$ 9,495,484.08
	RECYCLING - ONE DAY PER WEEK (BIWEEKLY) COLLECTION										
	Manual collection for Recycling.	1-C, 2-A, 2-D, 3-A, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F through 3-T, Article 4	Cost per year	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Automated collection using a 96 gallon container.	1-C, 2-A, 2-B, 2-C, 2-H, 2-D, 3-A, 3-B, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F through T, Article 4	Cost per year	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	RECYCLING - FIVE DAY PER WEEK (WEEKLY) COLLECTION										
	Manual collection for Recycling	1-C, 2-A, 2-D, 3-A, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F through 3-T, Article 4	Cost per year	\$ 1,306,773.00	\$ 9,686,065.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,434,463.00	\$ 10,570,417.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Automated collection using a 64 gallon container	1-C, 2-A, 2-B, 2-C, 2-H, 2-D, 3-A, 3-B, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F through T, Article 4	Cost per year	\$ 1,540,885.00	\$ 11,421,349.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,616,652.00	\$ 9,296,393.00	No Bid	No Bid
	RECYCLING - ONE DAY PER WEEK (WEEKLY) COLLECTION										
Manual collection for Recycling.	1-C, 2-A, 2-D, 3-A, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F through 3-T, Article 4	Cost per year	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Automated collection using a 64 gallon container	1-C, 2-A, 2-B, 2-C, 2-H, 2-D, 3-A, 3-B, 3-C, 3-E(b), 3-F through T, Article 4	Cost per year	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
ITEM 3. Overflow Program	OVERFLOW PROGRAM OPTION										
	Additional Cart Rentals	2-I	Cost per year/cart	\$ 75.00				\$ 75.00		\$ 75.00	
M 4. Leaves and Grass	LEAVES AND GRASS COLLECTION										
	Four (4) city-wide leaves and grass collection days	2-E	Cost per year	\$ 50,000.00	\$ 260,202.00	\$ 79,980.00	\$ 604,680.00	\$ 50,000.00	\$ 368,446.00	\$ 62,400.00	\$ 478,137.64
	Additional Days	2-E	Cost per day	\$ 12,500.00	\$ 65,050.00	\$ 22,000.00		\$ 12,600.00	\$ 92,110.00	\$ 15,600.00	\$ 119,632.00

ITEM 5. Rebate	ITEM 5. a										
	REBATE ON RECYCLABLE MATERIAL										
	Zero(0) Floor	3-S	Rebate per ton	None	None	None	None	None	None		
ITEM 6. Bulky Waste	BULKY WASTE CURBSIDE COLLECTION										
	Attach proposal and/or price sheet for bulky waste items.	2-F	Cost Per year								
	Alternative Proposals by Vendor										